
St.Helens R.F.C. 2020 Membership Options  

 

General  

• Members must select their preference from the three options by midnight on 
Tuesday 15 September 2020. 

• Each individual member’s preference must be registered separately even for 
tickets with multiple members on the same booking.  

• A member’s preferred option cannot be changed once submitted to the Club. 
• The Membership value or a refund or credit will be calculated against fixtures 

played behind closed doors or removed from the 2020 fixture list. 
• It will be assumed that members who do not select a preference by the 

deadline above are opting to donate their Membership value to the Club.  
• A membership price freeze will apply to renewing members who have chosen 

to donate or credited their Membership for the seasons 2021, 2022 and 2023.   
• Full details for 2021 memberships will be communicated by the Club at a later 

date. 

 

Donate 

• By selecting this option, members will not receive any refund or credit of their 
Membership value. 

• All membership category changes (e.g., Junior to Young Adult, Adult to 
Concession) will still apply, with the price being held for each relevant 
category. 

• The exact location of the tunnel branding is to be confirmed.  
• Please note: the personal details you have entered into the online form will be 

used for the design of our warm up shirt and tunnel decoration for the 2021 
season, so please ensure they are correct, we cannot take responsibility for 
information incorrectly entered into this form. 

• 10% off all products in the Saints Superstore for in-store orders for the 
duration of the 2021 season has fair usage limits and cannot be used in 
conjunction with any other offer or promotion. Subject to availability of product 
ranges and not available for online orders. Does not include delivery or 
postage costs. The Membership Holder must be present for the purchase, no 
other persons are authorised to use any Membership card that is not 
registered to them in relation to any benefit or special offer. 

• Prices will be pro-rata frozen in line with the number of competing Betfred 
Super League teams in the 2021 season.  

• All prize draws are made at the Club’s discretion with all prizes non-
transferable. 

• The Club reserves the right cancel or amend any of the above benefits at its 
discretion, at any time. 
  

 



Credit 

• The Club will determine the percentage discount based on the Membership 
value that will be applied, across the three seasons (2021, 2022 and 2023) 
this value will be equally split between these three seasons.  

• The Membership value or a refund or credit will be calculated against fixtures 
played behind closed doors or removed from the 2020 fixture list. 

• Discount can only be calculated on completion of the 2020 season, once the 
total amount of games missed is known 

• Membership must be renewed for all consecutive applicable seasons to 
receive full membership credit.  

• Should members choose not to renew their membership, there will be no cash 
alternative available. 

• All membership category changes (e.g. Junior to Young Adult, Adult to 
Concession) will still apply, with the price being held for each relevant 
category. 

 

Refund  

• The pro-rata refund will be calculated against fixtures played behind closed 
doors or removed from the fixture list 

• The total discount can only be calculated on completion of the 2020 season 
once the total amount of games missed is known. 

• Please allow up to 28 days from completion of the 2020 season for your 
refund to be processed. 

• Further details around refund payments are to follow to Members who select 
this option in due course.  

 


